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Race Director Note: 

Congratulations to our winners:   Nick and Alexandra and congratulations to 
all our runners who overcame the mile 2.5 hill and finished strongly.  I can’t 
explain how great it is to see families running together and often finishing together.  
Thank you for selling out our race, 3 days early, and setting a Redding race record 
of 1,264 registrants (I think we’re allowing it to go to 1,400 next year…shhhh).  Of 
the 1,100+ 5Kers, 200 were under the age of 13 = amazing!! 

Simply put, we could not do this thing without our incredible volunteers.  
Thank you to the Sun Family, Dave Shuford, Janet and Janet Bonomo, Lenore 
Pranzo, Evan Bassett, Lisa Mazinski, Julia Pemberton, the Redding Running Club 
and my family, who amazingly continue to let me direct these things.  

 Lisa, Mike and Dave, along with their huge pack of Scouts, really make this 
whole thing run smoothly.  They’re organizational skills and generosity with 
their time is unbelievable. 

 As for our first selectperson, Julia Pemberton, she wouldn’t want me to 
mention this but too bad!!  Julia was up at 3:30am Thanksgiving morning so 
she could get to the Redding Community Center and get the coffee going for 
our runners.  Julia isn’t only doing great things in our town, but, obviously 
she cares quite a bit about it.   

Looking back on Thanksgiving, I’m amazed, humbled and immensely thankful.  
One of a race director’s toughest tasks is pre-ordering all the gifts:  shirts, finishing 
medals, etc.  Of course, if you don’t give any of these things out (like a lot of 
races) then it’s easy, but that’s not the way we do things in Redding.  The first two 
years we had around 700 runners (the 2014 race was severely hampered by the 
weather), so when I ordered 1,250 finisher medals this June I was thinking I may 
be a bit crazy.  Come Tuesday before the race, when we sold out with over 1,250 
runners, making my purchases appropriate – so thank you!!   

 If you would like to, you can like and follow us on face book;  

https://www.facebook.com/The-Great-Turkey-Escape-5K-
560339030699203/?fref=ts 



 Lastly, please know that you are helping to do a lot of great things in our 
community.  The monies we’ve raised in this race (and its sister races, The 
Redding Road Race and the Rock’n Roots 9K) really have made a difference.  We 
raise over $65,000 a year, between the 3 races, for our beneficiaries. Some of our 
charities: 

 THE CHASE FUND 

 

http://www.cmakfoundation.org/ 
 

In remembrance of Chase Kowalski, the students and educators of the Sandy Hook 
tragedy, CMAK strives positive force to inspire community healing through family 
and children-focused initiatives and programs. By focusing on emotional healing 
and physical health & wellness, we will positively change the lives of children and 
their families. 



Chase’s best friend, Quinn McGuire, along with the McGuire Family all run the 
Great Turkey Escape is his honor and the Great Turkey Escape makes a donation 
to the Chase Fund on their behalf.  Quinn was not a runner but he is now!! I’m told 
that Chase’s Mom may run the race next year. 

 

Chase and Marybeth 

About Us 

Vision: To turn tragedy into triumph by healing and strengthening our families and 
communities. 

Mission: In remembrance of Chase Kowalski, the students and educators of the 
Sandy Hook tragedy, we will be a positive force to inspire community healing 
through family and children-focused initiatives and programs. By focusing on 
emotional healing and physical health and wellness, we will positively change the 
lives of children and their families. 



History: Chase Kowalski was an amazing son, brother, and friend who was taken 
from us on 12/14/12 in the Sandy Hook Elementary School tragedy. Chase’s heart 
was filled with love and he touched all of the people that he came into contact. He 
loved sports of all kinds and had an incredibly competitive spirit. Among Chase’s 
favorite sports were baseball, auto racing, and running. In fact, Chase began 
running competitively at age 2 in track races. At age 6, Chase asked to be entered 
into his first triathlon – in his first ever competition, he took on the field and won 
his age group! 

Goals:  The Kowalski family wanted to capture Chase’s competitive spirit and 
vitality in creating a charity in his honor with a focus on health and wellness for 
children and their families. CMAK (Chase Michael Anthony Kowalski) Sandy 
Hook Memorial Foundation has pursued programs and initiatives that encourage 
personal improvement, healthy lifestyles and strong family and communities.  

CMAK (Chase Michael Anthony Kowalski) Sandy Hook Memorial Foundation is 
a 501(C)(3) organization. Contributions to the foundation are tax deductible.   

RES PTA 
 
The Redding Elementary School PTA is a not-for-profit, national and state affiliated 
Parent Teacher Association.  Established in 1988, the PTA’s overarching goal is to 
build strong working relationships among parents, teachers and schools, in support 
of students.  These goals are accomplished through fundraisers and programs run 
solely by the efforts of volunteers. 
 
REDDING BOY SCOUTS 
 
The race is also helping to send Boy Scouts to Philmont Scout Ranch, the Boy 
Scouts of America's premier High Adventure base. Philmont challenges Scouts with 
over 214 square miles of rugged northern New Mexico wilderness, backpacking 
treks, horseback cavalcades, and training and service programs offer young people 
many ways to experience this legendary backcountry. Additionally, this year, a big 
portion of their funds are being allocated to an Eagle Scout in need of a Kidney 
transplant. 
 
REDDING HISTORICAL SOCIETY 
 
The Redding Historical Society is a non-profit organization with a mission is to 
educate, preserve and to promote Redding, Connecticut’s rich historic heritage. 



 
REDDING SOCIAL SERVICES 
 
Two years ago the race bought a commercial size freezer for Social Services to 
allow it to expand its food intake program. Last year we bought 20, $50 gift cards 
from Caraluzzi’s for Social Services to distribute to families in need over the 
holiday season. This year we donated $1,000 directly to RSS to use in the nest way 
they deem.  
 

NRVT FUND 
 
The Norwalk River Valley Trail (NRVT) project aims to build 38 miles of multi-
purpose trail connecting Calf Pasture Beach in Norwalk, Connecticut, and Rogers 
Park in Danbury, passing through Wilton, Ridgefield, and Redding on the way. 
 
In addition to creating recreational opportunities for walkers, hikers, cyclists, kids, 
pets and - on some stretches - equestrians, the NRVT will offer a green and healthy 
transportation alternative to reach rail stations, schools, offices, and businesses. 
 
Our donation to the NRVT Fund is earmarked for the Redding section. 
 
 
HELLO REDDING! 
 
This exciting and very timely not-for-profit e-magazine is one of the best things to 
happen in Redding in a long time.  Susan Winters does an incredible job of keeping 
Reddingites up to date on all of the area news. 
 
TAILS OF COURAGE 
 
Tails of Courage is a Christian based national non-profit organization committed to 
helping our communities. Founded in 2009, by a survivor of the World Trade Center 
attacks in New York City on September 11th, 2001, in an effort to honor the heroes 
lost in the tragedy, the mission of the organization is to help as much as possible 
with various programs within the communities we serve. We welcome everyone, 
from all walks of life, all beliefs, all backgrounds, and want to have a positive 
impact on the world around us. 
 



We are entirely funded by donations and depend on volunteers.  At present, Tails of 
Courage has Chapters in Connecticut, Pennsylvania, West Virginia and California.  
We allow and even encourage children under the age of 18 to volunteer with the 
shelter dogs and cats.  All children, regardless of age, may volunteer with Tails of 
Courage.  Children under 13 must have an adult accompany them.  We have 
partnered with local schools for children to obtain their community service, and 
most importantly to learn about the care of animals.  Families volunteer together. 
 
Our CT Chapter is home to our no-kill animal shelter located at 39 Smith Street, 
Danbury, CT 06810.  Our adoption hours are every day from 9:30 AM – 5:00 PM.  
You do not need an appointment. We are always happy to answer any questions 
about adopting a new pet and will gladly provide any support you may need 
throughout the adoption process. 
 
This is one of our Redding runners’, Lisa Mazinski, favorite charities.  She directs 
an August 5K in Danbury to benefit it.  Lisa and her Mom also donate a ton of time 
to this race as they ironed all the patches on to the turkey hats and secured all the 
chips onto the bibs. 
 
As you can hopefully see, you’ve made a huge difference in Redding!! 
 

John McCleary 

Race Director 



3/4 MILE RACE COURSE

 



5K RACE COURSE 

 



WINNERS: 

FEMALE 

1ST ALEXANDRA KAESLIN 

2ND SARA BELLES 

3RD GRACE HOUSE 

 

MALE 

1ST NICK FRATICELLI 

2ND TREVOR TAM 

3RD DAYSHAWN SIRANAULA 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 



 



 



 



 



 



 



 



 



 



 



 



 



 



 



 



 



 



 



 



SPONSORS – THANK YOU!! 

TITLE SPONSOR 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



PRESENTING SPONSORS 

 

 

 

MARSHALL KUTZ 
DMD 

 



 

 

 

 

 

MILE MARKER SPONSORS 

 

 

 



 

 

 

 

 



 

 

 



 

 

 

 



 

 



 

 

 



 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

 

 



 

 

THE PIZZO’S 

MY TWO SON’S FUND 

THE SHINALL FAMILY 

STUART AND SUSAN GREEN 

THE BOYLE FAMILY 

THE MCCLEARY FAMILY 



THE DAY IN PICTURES 

 

SUPPLIES (A PARTIAL PICTURE!!) 

 

SHOPPING FOR BANANAS 



 

BAG PICKUP 

 

DAVE WELCOMING RUNNERS INTO BAG PICKUP 



 

REINFORCEMENTS 

 

TO THE WINNERS GO THE SPOILS 

 



 

QUINN – THE FIRST HALL OF FAME INDUCTEE 

 



 

 

 

 



 

 

PIPER 



 

 

 



 

NICK – TAPE TO TAPE WINNER 

 



 

 

 



 



 

 

 

 

SOME OF THE FEEDBACK – thanks, it’s very much appreciated!! 

 

 My daughter is running next week.  I don't think I have met you in town, but 
I want to thank you for organizing this event.  From the gifts, training meet 
ups to Facebook posts, it is hard not to get excited about this event here in 
Redding.  Tina 

 Thank you for all of your hard work coordinating this exciting event.  It's a 
lot of work and it doesn't go unnoticed.  I look forward to meeting you on 
Wednesday.  Many thanks again.  Karin 

 Great race today! As always, you and your staff do an excellent job. Paul 

 Another great McCleary production!  So happy for all that the weather held 
out. People seemed to enjoy themselves. I hope you can relax and enjoy the 
rest of your day. Thea 



 Happy Thanksgiving! Thanks for another great Redding Race- as always, it 
was a lot of fun! See you in May! Miriam 

 THANK YOU for your efforts and communication around this race. I had a 
great time (my first time running the Great Turkey Escape) and love all the 
swag! My parents were signed up but chose not to run b/c of the cold. After 
seeing how much fun I had, they are determined to train so they can do the 
5K in under an hour next year! 
I am very excited to hear about the Redding Road Race advance 
registration.  
Hope you and your family have a great Thanksgiving!! Becky 

 Thanks for a lovely run John. Hope you continued to have a lovely 
thanksgiving. I'm pleased, coming off NYCM and a week of injury, to win 
2nd place in my age category. I'll keep a look out for future races with 
you.  Threphene 

 Thanks again for some terrific work organizing the race.  Congratulations on 
a terrific outcome! 
A highlight this year for me was a family first place in the M25-29 and M60-
64 brackets.  We wore the turkey hats proudly.  
Again, thank you. Marc 

 Great race!  Being from Texas I also appreciated the fact that it was not 
freezing this year!  Hope to make your May race as well.  Eileen 

 Great race!  Just a wonderful way for our family to start Today.  Thank you 
for all you have done to give this great event to our town.  Steve 

 Now that the dust has settled on the holiday weekend I wanted to take a 
moment to thank you very much for organizing such a fun race on 
Thursday.  It was my first Great Turkey Escape but definitely won't be my 
last, if for no other reason than to secure neighborhood bragging rights (a 
strained Achilles holds no weight in these parts).  When we told some 
friends about our participation in the race they immediately echoed what we 
experienced - that you clearly have a passion for putting on a good race and 
a good time.  Everyone we were with had a great morning. Will 
 



 

Happy holidays and hope to see you soon, 

 

John 


